


















CAUTION: This email originated from outside the State of Alaska mail system. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

From: Charles Wright
To: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored)
Cc: "Clerks"; nuniaqak@gmail.com
Subject: RE: License #3293 Protest License change
Date: Monday, December 30, 2024 3:23:39 PM
Attachments: image001.png

NUNIAQ STATEMENT CURRENT.pdf
NUNIAQ STATEMENT.pdf

To Whom it may concern.
 
I’m writing The ABC board to protest a liquor license change from Second Floor
Restaurant to Nuniaq LLC #3293
 
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Inc has tried to contact Melissa Berns multiple times by
mail, email and by phone to collect on her outstanding balance with Kodiak
Broadcasting Inc for advertising that she purchased in 2023. Her last payment was
August 10th, 2023, for $730.27. Her unpaid balance is $5631.58 that includes a
$756.11 service charge. For this reason, I must raise questions about this transfer until
the balance is paid in full. I have attached the bill with this email showing her last
payment in August 2023 and a current statement that shows no payment since
then. If needed I can also include email correspondence from 2024
acknowledging her outstanding balance.
 
Per request from the ABC Board, I have also included in this correspondence the
“Local Governing Body”, city of Kodiak, and the petitioner Nuniaq LLC
 
Thanks
Charles Wright General Manager
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Co., Inc.
HOT 101.1 KVOK-FM/KVOK-FM HD2 101.1 & 98.7 FM
Office 907-486-5159 ; cell 907-539-2777
1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A; Kodiak, AK 99615

Kodiak Island Broadcasting does not discriminate in the sale of advertising time and will accept no
advertising which is placed with an intent to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity. Any advertiser
certifies that it is not buying broadcast time on Kodiak Island Broadcasting stations for a discriminatory
purpose, including but not limited to decisions not to place advertising on particular stations on the basis
of race or ethnicity.
 

This message, including any attachments, is intended solely for the use of the named recipient
and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure, or distribution of this communication(s) is expressly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy any and all copies of the
original message.

mailto:charles@kvok.com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:Clerks@city.kodiak.ak.us
mailto:nuniaqak@gmail.com
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Wicks Broadcast Solutions, LLC.  Laz E-Forms 



™


STATEMENT DATE:


ACCOUNT NUMBER


AMOUNT DUE


INVOICE


NUMBER
INVOICE


DATE D E S C R I P T I O N AMOUNT BALANCE


          PAY THIS AMOUNT


DATE PREVIOUS BALANCE


CURRENT 30 DAYS 60 DAYS 90+ DAYS


AMOUNT PAID


PO Box 708    1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A   Kodiak AK  99615
Phone: 907-486-5159


10/8/24


NUNIAQ
113 LOWER MILL BAY RD
KODIAK, AK 99615


74536


      $5,558.45


69859 7/31/23 Contract #7453602 6/26/23 to 7/30/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $184.80
BALANCE OF INVOICE #69859       $184.80


69860 7/31/23 Contract #7453602 6/26/23 to 7/30/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $366.26
BALANCE OF INVOICE #69860       $366.26


70044 8/31/23 Contract #7453602 7/31/23 to 8/27/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $293.01
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70044       $293.01


70045 8/31/23 Contract #7453602 7/31/23 to 8/27/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $291.21
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70045       $291.21


70231 9/30/23 Contract #7453602 8/28/23 to 9/24/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $293.01
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70231       $293.01


70232 9/30/23 Contract #7453602 8/28/23 to 9/24/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $291.21
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70232       $291.21


70453 10/31/23 Contract #7453601 10/9/23 to 10/28/23 98.7 FM
HALLOWEEN SAFETY OPT2


Beginning Balance       $628.63
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70453       $628.63


70454 10/31/23 Contract #7453602 9/25/23 to 10/29/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Continued on next page
10/8/24 HOT 101.1 FM/KVOK 98.7 FM KODIAK, AK







Wicks Broadcast Solutions, LLC.  Laz E-Forms 



™


STATEMENT DATE:


ACCOUNT NUMBER


AMOUNT DUE


INVOICE


NUMBER
INVOICE


DATE D E S C R I P T I O N AMOUNT BALANCE


          PAY THIS AMOUNT


DATE PREVIOUS BALANCE


CURRENT 30 DAYS 60 DAYS 90+ DAYS


AMOUNT PAID


PO Box 708    1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A   Kodiak AK  99615
Phone: 907-486-5159


10/8/24


Page 2


NUNIAQ
113 LOWER MILL BAY RD
KODIAK, AK 99615


74536


Beginning Balance       $364.01
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70454       $364.01


70455 10/31/23 Contract #7453601 10/9/23 to 10/28/23 101.1FM
HALLOWEEN SAFETY OPT2


Beginning Balance       $628.63
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70455       $628.63


70456 10/31/23 Contract #7453602 9/25/23 to 10/29/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $366.26
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70456       $366.26


70697 11/30/23 Contract #7453602 10/30/23 to 11/26/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $291.21
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70697       $291.21


70698 11/30/23 Contract #7453602 10/30/23 to 11/26/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $293.01
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70698       $293.01


70914 12/31/23 Contract #7453602 11/27/23 to 12/24/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $293.01
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70914       $293.01


70915 12/31/23 Contract #7453602 11/27/23 to 12/24/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $291.21
BALANCE OF INVOICE #70915       $291.21


SrvChg Previous service charge balance       $682.98
TOTAL UNPAID SERVICE CHARGES       $682.98


  YTD Srv Chg
10/8/24       $5,558.45        $576.28 HOT 101.1 FM/KVOK 98.7 FM KODIAK, AK


        $682.98           $0.00           $0.00       $4,875.47       $5,558.45








Wicks Broadcast Solutions, LLC.  Laz E-Forms �


STATEMENT DATE:


ACCOUNT NUMBER


AMOUNT DUE


INVOICE


NUMBER


INVOICE
DATE D E S C R I P T I O N AMOUNT BALANCE


          PAY THIS AMOUNT


DATE PREVIOUS BALANCE


CURRENT 30 DAYS 60 DAYS 90+ DAYS


AMOUNT PAID


PO Box 708    1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A   Kodiak AK  99615
Phone: 907-486-5159


9/1/23


NUNIAQ
113 LOWERE MILL BAY RD
KODIAK, AK
99615


74536


      $1,135.28


69709 6/30/23 Contract #7453601 6/9/23 to 6/18/23 101.1FM
FATHER DAY OPT1


Beginning Balance       $275.53
8/10 From Ck#1103 $730.27      -$257.50
8/10 Sales Tax Check #1103 $730.27       -$18.03


BALANCE OF INVOICE  #69709         $0.00


69710 6/30/23 Contract #7453601 6/9/23 to 6/18/23 98.7 FM
FATHER DAY OPT1


Beginning Balance       $275.53
8/10 From Ck#1103 $730.27      -$257.50
8/10 Sales Tax Check #1103 $730.27       -$18.03


BALANCE OF INVOICE  #69710         $0.00


69859 7/31/23 Contract #7453602 6/26/23 to 7/30/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $364.01
8/10 From Ck#1103 $730.27      -$167.49
8/10 Sales Tax Check #1103 $730.27       -$11.72


BALANCE OF INVOICE  #69859       $184.80


69860 7/31/23 Contract #7453602 6/26/23 to 7/30/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


Beginning Balance       $366.26
BALANCE OF INVOICE  #69860       $366.26


70044 8/31/23 Contract #7453602 7/31/23 to 8/27/23 101.1FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


8/31  168  30's @ $1.63       $273.84
8/31 Sales Tax        $19.17


BALANCE OF INVOICE  #70044       $293.01


70045 8/31/23 Contract #7453602 7/31/23 to 8/27/23 98.7 FM
2023 6 MONTH OPT1


8/31  168  30's @ $1.62       $272.16
8/31 Sales Tax        $19.05


BALANCE OF INVOICE  #70045       $291.21


9/1/23       $1,281.33 HOT 101.1 FM/KVOK 98.7 FM KODIAK, AK


        $584.22         $551.06           $0.00           $0.00       $1,135.28







CAUTION: This email originated from outside the State of Alaska mail system. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

From: Melissa Berns
To: Charles Wright
Cc: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored); Clerks; Nate Svoboda
Subject: Re: License #3293 Protest License change
Date: Saturday, January 4, 2025 8:02:50 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Good Afternoon Mr. Wright, ABC Board and City of Kodiak, 
Upon receiving the email from Mr. Wright at KVOK I tried to reach out to him both at the
station and his personal cell but have not heard back from him. 

As a new business in 2023 I was approached to advertise on the radio. What was received was
definitely much more than what was presented to me.  I let the rep know this and don't know
what else I was signed up for; before I knew it I was receiving astronomical bills I couldn't
keep up with.  As a new business, clearly I should not have been advertising, as I was working
my hardest to get established in a very old building and industry with many continued
challenges.  
Our business plan and model included the sales of beer and wine; this is the only way it can
survive.  We applied for this license transfer well over a year ago with the hopes of generating
extra revenue that would help get our head above water; yet we continue to wait.  I would
appreciate your continued support to get this transfer completed so that we can provide the
services we have hoped for since inception.

Respectfully,
Melissa

Melissa Berns, Chef/Owner

113 Lower Millbay Road
Kodiak, Alaska 99615
Phone: 907-481-1660
Cell: 907-202-1139
visit us at www.nuniaq.com

On Mon, Dec 30, 2024 at 3:23 PM Charles Wright <charles@kvok.com> wrote:

To Whom it may concern.

 

I’m writing The ABC board to protest a liquor license change from Second

mailto:nuniaqak@gmail.com
mailto:charles@kvok.com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:Clerks@city.kodiak.ak.us
mailto:svoboda.nate@gmail.com
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.nuniaq.com%2F&data=05%7C02%7Calcohol.licensing%40alaska.gov%7C3c28ebac34bd4fbf6a2108dd2d4632a0%7C20030bf67ad942f7927359ea83fcfa38%7C0%7C0%7C638716501697166803%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=VtR6b38kO1NXzw8S%2Bj%2F3FCvcMtFPvRT1pLUvCUZ3Cyc%3D&reserved=0
mailto:charles@kvok.com
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Floor Restaurant to Nuniaq LLC #3293

 

Kodiak Island Broadcasting Inc has tried to contact Melissa Berns multiple
times by mail, email and by phone to collect on her outstanding balance
with Kodiak Broadcasting Inc for advertising that she purchased in 2023. Her
last payment was August 10th, 2023, for $730.27. Her unpaid balance is
$5631.58 that includes a $756.11 service charge. For this reason, I must raise
questions about this transfer until the balance is paid in full. I have attached
the bill with this email showing her last payment in August 2023 and a current
statement that shows no payment since then. If needed I can also include
email correspondence from 2024 acknowledging her outstanding balance.

 

Per request from the ABC Board, I have also included in this correspondence
the “Local Governing Body”, city of Kodiak, and the petitioner Nuniaq LLC

 

Thanks

Charles Wright General Manager
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Co., Inc.
HOT 101.1 KVOK-FM/KVOK-FM HD2 101.1 & 98.7 FM
Office 907-486-5159 ; cell 907-539-2777
1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A; Kodiak, AK 99615

Kodiak Island Broadcasting does not discriminate in the sale of advertising time and will accept no
advertising which is placed with an intent to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity. Any
advertiser certifies that it is not buying broadcast time on Kodiak Island Broadcasting stations for a
discriminatory purpose, including but not limited to decisions not to place advertising on particular
stations on the basis of race or ethnicity.

 

This message, including any attachments, is intended solely for the use of the named recipient
and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure, or distribution of this communication(s) is expressly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy any and all copies of
the original message.

 

 



CAUTION: This email originated from outside the State of Alaska mail system. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

From: Charles Wright
To: "Melissa Berns"
Cc: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored); "Clerks"; "Nate Svoboda"
Subject: RE: License #3293 Protest License change
Date: Monday, January 6, 2025 9:28:30 AM
Attachments: image001.png

I’m here most weekdays from 7am to 4pm. I did call you back but no answer. I am
also reachable via email. We have reached out to you regarding your outstanding
balance on 3-8-24, 4-25-24 and 7-31-24 with no response. You receive a monthly
statement showing your past due balance as well as service charges accumulating
on this account to the mailing and physical address of this business at 113 Lower Mill
Bay Rd. I find it hard that you would not understand what you were getting into
since we do send out monthly statements as well as you were in direct contact with
your sales rep at the time of this advertising as she also worked for you part time.

We understand that it takes a lot to get a new business established which is why we
have carried the debt for over a year. I have offered payment plans via email on
the above dates with no response. Please get in touch with me for a debt
settlement. I’m sure we can come up with an amicable solution so that we can
withdraw our protest to this license change.

Charles Wright General Manager
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Co., Inc.
HOT 101.1 KVOK-FM/KVOK-FM HD2 101.1 & 98.7 FM
Office 907-486-5159 ; cell 907-539-2777
1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A; Kodiak, AK 99615

Kodiak Island Broadcasting does not discriminate in the sale of advertising time and will accept no
advertising which is placed with an intent to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity. Any advertiser
certifies that it is not buying broadcast time on Kodiak Island Broadcasting stations for a discriminatory
purpose, including but not limited to decisions not to place advertising on particular stations on the basis
of race or ethnicity.

This message, including any attachments, is intended solely for the use of the named recipient
and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure, or distribution of this communication(s) is expressly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy any and all copies of the
original message.

From: Melissa Berns <nuniaqak@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, January 4, 2025 8:03 PM

mailto:charles@kvok.com
mailto:nuniaqak@gmail.com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:Clerks@city.kodiak.ak.us
mailto:svoboda.nate@gmail.com
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To: Charles Wright <charles@kvok.com>
Cc: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>; Clerks
<Clerks@city.kodiak.ak.us>; Nate Svoboda <svoboda.nate@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: License #3293 Protest License change

 
Good Afternoon Mr. Wright, ABC Board and City of Kodiak, 
Upon receiving the email from Mr. Wright at KVOK I tried to reach out to him both at the
station and his personal cell but have not heard back from him. 
 
As a new business in 2023 I was approached to advertise on the radio. What was
received was definitely much more than what was presented to me.  I let the rep know
this and don't know what else I was signed up for; before I knew it I was receiving
astronomical bills I couldn't keep up with.  As a new business, clearly I should not have
been advertising, as I was working my hardest to get established in a very old building
and industry with many continued challenges.  
Our business plan and model included the sales of beer and wine; this is the only way it
can survive.  We applied for this license transfer well over a year ago with the hopes of
generating extra revenue that would help get our head above water; yet we continue to
wait.  I would appreciate your continued support to get this transfer completed so that
we can provide the services we have hoped for since inception.
 
Respectfully,
Melissa
 
 
Melissa Berns, Chef/Owner

113 Lower Millbay Road
Kodiak, Alaska 99615
Phone: 907-481-1660
Cell: 907-202-1139
visit us at www.nuniaq.com
 
 
On Mon, Dec 30, 2024 at 3:23 PM Charles Wright <charles@kvok.com> wrote:

To Whom it may concern.
 

https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.nuniaq.com%2F&data=05%7C02%7Calcohol.licensing%40alaska.gov%7C66479adfdb2e4bda5def08dd2e7fe91c%7C20030bf67ad942f7927359ea83fcfa38%7C0%7C0%7C638717849096487487%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=OtJ6sPNe4rVdr8LzxzDLUIWgT68u9O2yoV7E%2FVglJdY%3D&reserved=0
mailto:charles@kvok.com


I’m writing The ABC board to protest a liquor license change from Second
Floor Restaurant to Nuniaq LLC #3293
 
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Inc has tried to contact Melissa Berns multiple
times by mail, email and by phone to collect on her outstanding balance
with Kodiak Broadcasting Inc for advertising that she purchased in 2023. Her
last payment was August 10th, 2023, for $730.27. Her unpaid balance is
$5631.58 that includes a $756.11 service charge. For this reason, I must raise
questions about this transfer until the balance is paid in full. I have attached
the bill with this email showing her last payment in August 2023 and a current
statement that shows no payment since then. If needed I can also include
email correspondence from 2024 acknowledging her outstanding balance.
 
Per request from the ABC Board, I have also included in this correspondence
the “Local Governing Body”, city of Kodiak, and the petitioner Nuniaq LLC
 
Thanks
Charles Wright General Manager
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Co., Inc.
HOT 101.1 KVOK-FM/KVOK-FM HD2 101.1 & 98.7 FM
Office 907-486-5159 ; cell 907-539-2777
1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A; Kodiak, AK 99615

Kodiak Island Broadcasting does not discriminate in the sale of advertising time and will accept no
advertising which is placed with an intent to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity. Any
advertiser certifies that it is not buying broadcast time on Kodiak Island Broadcasting stations for a
discriminatory purpose, including but not limited to decisions not to place advertising on particular
stations on the basis of race or ethnicity.

 

This message, including any attachments, is intended solely for the use of the named recipient
and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure, or distribution of this communication(s) is expressly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy any and all copies of
the original message.
 
 



From: Charles Wright
To: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored)
Subject: RE: AS 04.09.210 Protest License change
Date: Wednesday, January 22, 2025 12:04:17 PM
Attachments: image001.png

I expect to receive the final payment from Nuniaq soon once we receive that
payment we will remove our objection. We have received half the balance.
 
Charles Wright General Manager
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Co., Inc.
HOT 101.1 KVOK-FM/KVOK-FM HD2 101.1 & 98.7 FM
Office 907-486-5159 ; cell 907-539-2777
1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A; Kodiak, AK 99615

Kodiak Island Broadcasting does not discriminate in the sale of advertising time and will accept no
advertising which is placed with an intent to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity. Any advertiser
certifies that it is not buying broadcast time on Kodiak Island Broadcasting stations for a discriminatory
purpose, including but not limited to decisions not to place advertising on particular stations on the basis
of race or ethnicity.
 

This message, including any attachments, is intended solely for the use of the named recipient
and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure, or distribution of this communication(s) is expressly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy any and all copies of the
original message.
 
 
From: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2025 11:54 AM
To: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>; Charles Wright
<charles@kvok.com>
Subject: RE: AS 04.09.210 Protest License change

 
Hello Mr. Wright,
 
Your objection to the transfer of license #3293, Second Floor Restaurant has been included in
the board packet that is going before the board for consideration at the February 4th, 2025
meeting. I encourage you to be available for this meeting if you’d like to speak to your
objection. I have included the meeting information below.
 
ABC Board Meeting
Date: Tuesday, February 4th, 2025
Time: 9:00am - 5:00pm AKST
Where: Juneau State Office Building (JSOB) Conference Room A (333 Willoughby Ave,

mailto:charles@kvok.com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov

&VOK





Juneau, AK 99801)
Zoom Info
Meeting Link: https://amco-alaska-gov.zoom.us/j/83744283445?
pwd=cItgbyxezaB2W5u0Zub75jmY2Sd2fC.1
Meeting ID: 837 4428 3445
Passcode: 722999
Telephone: One tap mobile
+17193594580,,83744283445# US
+12532050468,,83744283445# US
 
Thank you,
 
Sonya Irwin
Records and Licensing Supervisor
Alcohol and Marijuana Control Office
550 W. 7th Avenue, Suite 1600
Anchorage, Ak 99501
(907)269-0350
Alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
 
From: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored) 
Sent: Monday, December 30, 2024 12:54 PM
To: Charles Wright <charles@kvok.com>; CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored)
<alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>
Subject: RE: AS 04.09.210 Protest License change

 
Hello Mr. Wright,
 
If you wish to submit an objection of the transfer of license #3293, Second Floor Restaurant
you will need to submit written comment to their local governing body, the applicant, and to
the Alcoholic Beverage Control Board at 550 West 7th Ave. Suite 1600 Anchorage AK 99501 or
alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.
 
AS 04.11.470. Objection. A person may object to an application for issuance, renewal,
transfer of location, or transfer to another person of a license, for issuance, renewal, or
transfer to another person of a license with one or more endorsements, for issuance of an
endorsement, or for issuance of a permit by serving upon the applicant and the board the
reasons for the objection. The board shall consider the objections and testimony received at a
hearing conducted under AS 04.11.510(b)(2) when it considers the application. An objection
and the record of a hearing conducted under AS 04.11.510(b)(2) shall be retained as part of the
board's permanent record of its review of the application.
 
Thank you,
 

https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Famco-alaska-gov.zoom.us%2Fj%2F83744283445%3Fpwd%3DcItgbyxezaB2W5u0Zub75jmY2Sd2fC.1&data=05%7C02%7Calcohol.licensing%40alaska.gov%7Ce7252d15555f432d193f08dd3b2852be%7C20030bf67ad942f7927359ea83fcfa38%7C0%7C0%7C638731766572955938%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=gxQnyRK4y8g251P96EoobPcu6xdS0z3E%2B1dNMwaMvNc%3D&reserved=0
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Famco-alaska-gov.zoom.us%2Fj%2F83744283445%3Fpwd%3DcItgbyxezaB2W5u0Zub75jmY2Sd2fC.1&data=05%7C02%7Calcohol.licensing%40alaska.gov%7Ce7252d15555f432d193f08dd3b2852be%7C20030bf67ad942f7927359ea83fcfa38%7C0%7C0%7C638731766572955938%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=gxQnyRK4y8g251P96EoobPcu6xdS0z3E%2B1dNMwaMvNc%3D&reserved=0
mailto:Alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:charles@kvok.com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov


CAUTION: This email originated from outside the State of Alaska mail system. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

You don't often get email from charles@kvok.com. Learn why this is important

Sonya Irwin
Records and Licensing Supervisor
Alcohol and Marijuana Control Office
550 W. 7th Avenue, Suite 1600
Anchorage, Ak 99501
(907)269-0350
Alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
 
From: Charles Wright <charles@kvok.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2024 3:56 PM
To: CED ABC Alcohol Licensing (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>
Subject: AS 04.09.210 Protest License change

 

To Whom it may concern.
 
I’m Writing The ABC board to protest a liquor license change from Second Floor
Restaurant to Nuniaq LLC AS 04.09.210.
 
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Inc has tried to contact Melissa Berns multiple times by
mail, email and by phone to collect on her outstanding balance with Kodiak
Broadcasting Inc for advertising that she purchased in 2023. Her last payment was
August 10th, 2023, for $730.27. Her unpaid balance is $5631.58 that includes a
$756.11 service charge. For this reason, I must raise questions about this transfer until
the  balance is paid in full. I have attached the bill with this email showing her last
payment in August 2023 and a current statement that shows no payment since
then. If needed I can also include email correspondence from 2024
acknowledging her outstanding balance.
 
Charles Wright General Manager
Kodiak Island Broadcasting Co., Inc.
HOT 101.1 KVOK-FM/KVOK-FM HD2 101.1 & 98.7 FM
Office 907-486-5159 ; cell 907-539-2777
1315 Mill Bay Road Suite A; Kodiak, AK 99615

Kodiak Island Broadcasting does not discriminate in the sale of advertising time and will accept no
advertising which is placed with an intent to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity. Any advertiser
certifies that it is not buying broadcast time on Kodiak Island Broadcasting stations for a discriminatory
purpose, including but not limited to decisions not to place advertising on particular stations on the basis
of race or ethnicity.
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This message, including any attachments, is intended solely for the use of the named recipient
and may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure, or distribution of this communication(s) is expressly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy any and all copies of the
original message.
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